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‘Baboon syndrome’ (BS) is a term primarily used to 
describe a mercury-induced skin eruption after previ-
ous sensitization to this chemical element, which was 
introduced in 1984 by Andersen et al. [1, 2]. This term is 
related to the clinical picture of confluent erythematous 
lesions involving buttocks which resemble red buttocks 
of baboons [3, 4]. Since then, there have been multiple 
case reports considering this clinical description but tak-
ing into account various pathogenesis: drug-induced and 
non-drug induced (allergenic and non-allergenic). There-
fore, a great confusion regarding this term occurred and 
some researchers have tried to review this syndrome cre-
ating a new classification [2]. 

A 74-year-old man, with the history of arterial hyper-
tension, gout, hepatic cirrhosis and osteoarthritis, was 
admitted to the Dermatology Department in order to di-
agnose and treat skin lesions persisting for 5 days. The 
day the lesions occurred the patient was discharged from 
the orthopaedic ward where he had undergone left hip 
cementless endoprosthesoplasty due to osteoarthritis. 
CORIN Trinity 56 acetabular cup, asymmetrical liner, Mini-
hip 6 stem, 40/-4 head had been implanted. At hospital 
he had also received multiple medications, e.g. enoxapa-
rin, oxycodone, pseudoephedrine, bupivacaine, tramadol 
and gentamicin. The first skin lesion, an erythematous 
patch, appeared on the thigh while the patient was just 
about to be discharged from the orthopaedic ward. After 
coming back home an eruption of new erythematous-
papular lesions occurred, therefore the patient called an 
ambulance and he was administered intramuscular anti-
histamines and intravenous glucocorticoids. On the third 
day, another flare appeared, therefore the patient pre-
sented to the Department of Dermatology. On admission 
confluent erythematous-infiltrative lesions in the area of 
buttocks (Figure 1), neck and cleavage in a V-shape were 
observed as well as symmetrical erythematous-infiltra-
tive and erythematous-papular lesions within the back, 
thighs, cubital and axillary fossae (Figures 2, 3). The skin 
lesions were not accompanied by fever or joint pain. Of 
the laboratory investigations there was normocytic anae-

mia and slight C-reactive protein elevation observed 
with no eosinophilia. During the interview the patient 
reported two similar episodes in the past: 13 years ear-
lier he was diagnosed with drug rash with eosinophilia 
and systemic symptoms (DRESS), most probably due to 
allopurinol, colchicine or nonsteroidal anti-inflammatory 
drugs. Moreover, 7 years earlier, a very similar reaction 
occurred, probably due to allopurinol or naproxen as well, 
therefore he was hospitalized at our Department, but at 
that time he did not fulfil the criteria of DRESS, so the 
diagnosis of dermatitis due to unspecified substance 
taken internally was made. During the current episode 
at our Department, enoxaparin was stopped, replaced 
by an oral anticoagulant, hydrocortisone intravenously 
100 mg three times a day and topical glucocorticoid 
ointments were introduced. A spectacular improvement 
was noted: on the second day of hospitalization, ery-
thema of the cleavage and limbs resolved. We contacted 
the orthopaedic surgeons who performed the patient’s 
surgery and discussed further proceedings. The patient 
was scheduled for patch tests after stopping the therapy 
with glucocorticoids and antihistamines. Basing on the 

Figure 1. Symmetrical erythematous-infiltrative lesions on 
both buttocks. Dressing after the hip surgery on the left 
buttock
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patient’s medical history and physical examination, as 
well as laboratory tests, the baboon syndrome was diag-
nosed. Most probable inducing factors were the medica-
tions given during orthopaedic surgery, however it was 
not possible to identify the specific drug as the ultimate 
trigger. After administered treatment the skin lesions re-
solved completely and the patient was discharged home 
with a recommendation of follow-up in an ambulatory 
care setting.

Different pathogenic mechanisms can result in the 
clinical picture of the baboon syndrome but there are 
three main suggested [2]. First, the classical BS occurs 
due to parenteral allergen intake after primary contact 
sensitization to the same substance, excluding drugs 
[2, 5]. The second type of BS is contact-allergenic drug-
induced BS and the third is non-contact allergenic drug 
induced BS called symmetrical drug-related intertrigi-
nous and flexural exanthema (SDRIFE) [2]. Nevertheless, 
the diagnosis is based on clinical features: (1) well-de-
marcated erythema involving the gluteal or perianal area 
and/or V-shaped erythema in the inguinal and perigenital 
area; (2) the involvement of at least one intertriginous 
or flexural area; (3) symmetry of the affected areas; and  
(4) the absence of systemic symptoms [2]. The reason for 
such flexural localization of lesions is not certain, but it 
is suspected to be due to sweating and local occlusion 
[4]. Our patient has met all of the listed criteria, although 

the specific drug causing them all has not been identified 
as he received such broad treatment. BS can be caused 
by either topically or systemically applied substances. 
Among the systemic offending agents most commonly 
responsible are: β-lactam antibiotics, especially amoxi-
cillin, mercury, nickel, pseudoephedrine, contrast media 
containing barium, allopurinol, oxycodone, naproxen, 
heparin, oral neomycin, oral glucocorticoids and many 
more, whereas our patient received even four of them 
[2]. The probable time interval between drug adminis-
tration and occurrence of skin lesions is usually from  
a couple of hours to 2 days [6]. Other possible triggers for 
clinical manifestation of BS may be infections, bacterial 
(especially streptococcal) or viral [2]. There is no specific 
test confirming the diagnosis – it is based on the clinical 
picture and exclusion of other potential causes, although 
the cause and effect relationship with a medication can 
be confirmed in the controlled drug provocation test [6]. 
Usually, there are no general symptoms, and laboratory 
data or histopathological examination are not useful [2]. 
Skin lesions are often self-limiting, although intravenous 
glucocorticoids, which shorten the duration of the dis-
ease, can be administered [6]. In the described case, after 
administration of intravenous hydrocortisone in lowering 
doses starting with 100 mg three times a day, as well 
as intramuscular and oral antihistamines and topical hy-
drocortisone ointment, the lesions improved quickly and 
at the end of hospitalization, 8 days altogether, resolved 
completely. 
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